Chico Unified School District
Nutritional Services

Price Quote for Delivery to Warehouse
July 1, 2017 through June 31, 2018

Supplier:

Signature:

Printed Name:
Date:

Est.
Annual | GOLD Unit
Item Description Product Specification Pack Size | Usage | STAR | Danielson | SYSCO S&L Price Comments
BAR, STRAWBERRY NUTRIGRAIN 86 CT. CASE 48 CT. 12015 2198 | § 2783| § 2678 28.71
CEREAL, BLUEBERRY SPOONER 48/2 OZ. MALQ © MEAL OR KELLOGG'S BRAND CASE 4812 300[S  16.34 | § 17.14 N/A 19.61
OZ.
CEREAL, CHEERIC 86 CT. GENERAL MILLS REDUCED SUGAR CASE 96 CT. 60[S 1966 | 5 1666| § 1795 19.36
CEREAL, HONEY SCOCTERS 4812 OZ. MALT G MEAL OR KELLOGG'S BRAND CASE 4872 400[S 1834 | § 1714 §  19.00 19.61
oz.
CEREAL, RAISIN BRAN 96 CT. KELLOGGS REDUCED SUGAR CASE 96 CT. 50[§ 2351 § 1665 § 2147 25.20
CEREAL, RICE KRISPIES 86 CT. CASE 96 CT. 505 2351 |S 1665 § 2147 19.12
CEREAL, SPOONER FROSTED MINI 4872 MALT O MEAL OR KELLOGG'S BRAND CASE 4872 450(5 1834 | S 1714 § 19.09 19.65
oz 0Z.
CHEX MIX, SIMPLY CHEDDAR 60 CT. SB 12 COMPLIANT CASE 175§ 2057 | 5 1958 §  18.83 21.70
0 TRANS FAT WHOLE GRAIN CASE 60115 s  14.03 15.92
CRAGKER, GHEEATS 805 502 CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION INFORMATION PROVIDED |02, SOl 1302
CRACKER, GRAHAM 150/2 CT. 3 PACK, SB 12 COMPLIANT CASE 50(5 19.83 | § 1702 8 16.08 17.64
CRACKER, SALTINE 50072 PK, CASE 50012 50[§ 1172 § 1853 § 1605 11.08
PK.
5612 COMPLIANT FIELDSTONE OR SIMILIAR BRAND 3
GRANOLA, IND. 100/2.0 0Z RO " CASE 380|874 S aar| 8 3474 36.52
SB12 COMPLIANT FIELDSTONE OR SIMILIAR BRAND N/A 82.50
GLUTEN FREE GRANGLA, IND, 100/2.0 0Z CASE 100|$ 3904 N/A /
RAISINS, IND 144 CT CASE 14413 300(§ 4125| S 2354| g 28.08 39.21
0Z.
SCOOBY DOO GRAHAM STICKS 210 CT. SB 12 COMPLIANT CASE 210 50[§ 4222 | 5 41378 3907 43.10
cT.
SNACK, CHEEZIT WG 175/.75 OZ. WHOLE GRAIN CASE 200(S 2018 | § 2950| § 2793 30.70
SB 12 COMPLIANT 175475 OZ.
SNACK, CORNUT TAJIN 100/.725 OZ, CASE 80($ 4903 | § 1977 ¢ 21.56 20.23
100/.725 OZ.
SNACK, CORNUT, RANCH 100/.725 OZ. CASE 80[$ 4903 | S 1977 §  21.56 20.23
100/.725 OZ.
SNACK, POPPED CRISPS, HONEY BEQ BAKED CASE 601,78 250( 1448 | § 1512 § 1340 16.25
607,78 OZ. SB 12 COMPLIANT oZ.
SNACK, WG GOLDFISH PUFFS 300 CT. WHOLE GRAIN CASE 100§ 56.75 NIA N/A 53.09
SB 12 COMPLIANT
SUNFLOWER SEEDS 150 CT. LIGHTLY SALTED CASE 300/ $ 3683 $ 2116| § 31.17 32.56
0 TRANS FAT 150110 0Z




Chico Unified School District

Nutritional Services

Price Quote for Delivery to Warehouse
July 1, 2017 through June 31, 2018

Est.
Annual | GOLD
Item Description Product Specification Pack Size | Usage | STAR Danielson | ROB ROSS | SYSCO PPF S&L Comment
DISPENSER PACK CASE 2/1.5 $ 33.61] § 33.51 N/A $ 32.48 NIA 48.08
MAYONAISE 2/1.5 GAL. 0 TRANS FATS GAL. 20
DISPENSER PUMPS MUST BE PROVIDED
MAYONAISE 4/1 GAL REDUCED FAT 4/1 GALLON CASE 4/1 10 § 2633 8 18.25 N/A t 4948 N/A 26,70
GAL.
MAYONAISE IND 500 CT CASE 500 B0l § 1579 § 14.84 N/A $ 1545 N/A 15.41
CT.
DISPENSER PACK CASE 2/1.5 $ 22.05| § 15.60 N/A $ 15.28 N/A 17.20
MUSTARD 2/1.5 GAL © TRANS FATS GAL. 30
DISPENSER PUMPS MUST BE PROVIDED
MUSTARD, IND 500 CT CASE 500 80| § 5928 4.68 N/A s 536 N/A 4.68
CT.
PAN SPRAY 22 OZ. CAN *** PAN COATING 6/22 QZ. CANS CASE 6/22 &0 § 34.83| § 15.78 29.55 $ 12.58 N/A 24.79
oZ.
- 41 GALLON DILL PICKLE CHIPS CASE 4/1 $  36.66| 3 16.45 N/A 5 19.69 N/A 20.54
PICKLE, CHIP 4/1GAL 0 TRANS FATS GAL. 300
DISPENSER PACK CASE 2/1.5 $  3625|8% 31,94 N/A 3 31.23 N/A 41,68
RANCH DRESSING 2/1.5 GAL 0 TRANS FAT MUST PROVIDE DISPENSERS GAL. 80
RANCH DRESSING 4/1 GAL, 0 TRANS FATS CASE 4/1 100§ 3865 | $ 25.88 N/A 3§ 3133 N/A 36.23
GAL.
RANCH IND 100 CT. CASE 200 Bl 1122 |8 5.66 N/A 5 534 NIA 5.84
CT.
SAUCE, BBQ 2/1.5 GAL. POUCHES 0 TRANS FATS CASE 2/1.5 $ 3200 |8 29,92 N/A 3 2915 N/A 41,98
HELLMAN BRAND DISPENSER PUMPS MUST BE PROVIDED GAL. 125
CATTLEMANS BRAND OR SAMPLES CASE 4/1 § 38138 27.19 N/A $ 40,00 N/A 26.67
SAUCE, BBQ CATTLEMENS 4/1 GAL*™* |0 TRANS FATS GAL. 30
SAUCE, BBQ IND. CASE 200 50| 627 | $ 472 N/A $ 8.41 N/A 4.80
CT.
CONTADINA BRAND OR SAMPLES $ 2246 | § 13.16 N/A N/A N/A 26.57
SAUCE, PIZZA 6410 0 TRANS FATS 6/#10 PER CASE 30
CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION INFORMATION PROVIDED
SAUCE, SOY IND. 500 CT. CASE 500 100( § 1325 | & 7.15 N/A $ 6.84 N/A 23.30
CT,
SAUCE, TACO IND. 500 CT. 500 OR 1000 CT. CASE 500 400§ 1151 | S 10.03 N/A s 1043 N/A 10.40 |Brand
B OR 9 GRAM CT.
SAUCE, TERIYAKI 6/5 LB, KIKKOMAN BRAND CASES/5LE. 50ls 5458 |8 30.07 N/A $ 3913 N/A 35.27 |Brand
0 TRANS FAT S 1948 | § 12.23 N/A $ 1894 | % 1975 13.33
SAUCE, TOMATO 6##10 CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION INFORMATION PROVIDED CASE 640 75
BID BOTH 610 CANS AND 6/#10 POUCHES
0 TRANS FAT 3 3486 | § 2222 N/A $ 26.47 N/A 24.99
SAUGCE, TOMATO PASTE 6/#10 CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION INFORMATION PROVIDED CASE 6410 50
SYRUP, IND. 100 CT. 100 CT IND. CASE 100 400§ 1244 | 8 4.55 N/A $ 432 N/A 4.67
0 TRANS FAT CT.
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JUICE, A & E APPLE 40/4.23 OZ. APPLE AND EVE 100 % JUICE CASE 200] $ 735 § 6.61|6.67

40/4.23 OZ. N/A
JUICE, A & E OJITANG 40/4 23 OZ. APPLE AND EVE 100 % JUICE CASE 200| & 7368 6.61]6.67 }

40/4.23 OZ N/A
JUICE, A & E APPLE 36/6.75 QZ. APPLE AND EVE 100 PERCENT JUICE CASE 600| § 911 8.72|8.25

36/6.75 OZ. N/A
JUICE, A & E FRUIT PUNCH 36/6.75 OZ. APPLE AND EVE 100 PERCENT JUICE CASE 600 § 911 $ 842|825

36/6.75 OZ. N/A
JUICE, A & E ORANGE 36/6.75 OZ. APPLE AND EVE 100 PERCENT JUICE CASE 500| & 911] 8 842|825

36/6.75 0Z, N/A
JUICE, A & E VERY BERRY 36/8.75 OZ APPLE AND EVE 100 PERCENT JUICE CASE 500] § 911] & 842|825

36/6.75 OZ. N/A
JUICE, FRUIT SWITCH 24/8 OZ. CANS CASE 24/8 500| § 1475 8 12.07|11.64

0Z. CANS N/A
WATER, LARGE 35/16.8 OZ. CASE 500( $7.72 35ct 4.26 35¢t it Pri >

i L. 3.97 35¢t 327 24/16 .90z Unit Price/Pack Size
WATER, SMALL 48/8 OZ, CASE 56/8 300| $6.07 48ct 5.98 56¢t 6.02 48¢ct Unit Price/Pack Size

OZ.

4.16 28/80z
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BUTTER, UNSALTED 30/1 LB, UNSALTED BUTTER30/1 LB. CASE CASE 30/1 LB. 200 §  91.14] § 78.60| 97.67 |8 7539 | § 72.00
3 82.81
ELOCKS OR 4/3 LB. BLOCKS CHEESE, CREAM 473 LB. 2
CHEESE, CREAM 10/3 LB, BLOCK™* TELRR L i N/A b e $ 59.70
CHEESE, IND CREAM CUPS 100 CT 100 PERCENT CHEESE CASE 100 OZ. 250 5 19.73| 15.69 3 1998 | 5 19.75
N/A $ 15.91
LOW FAT CASE 4/1 GAL 3 3996| § 18.56 $ 4570 | $ 54,75
0 TRANS FAT
DRESSING, CAESAR 2/1 GAL™™* CN LABEL PREFERRED CR NUTRITION 50
INFORMATION PROVIDED N/A $ 48.25
— CASE 60/8 OZ. CARTONS 3 8.17 NIA $ 6.43 Site to Site delivery
MILK, FATFREE 60/8 OZ. CARTONS FATFREE MILK 350000 N/A N/A $ 9.38
MILK, SOY 60/8 OZ. CARTONS SOY MILK GASERROL IRIONS asoopt| § 17.00 N/A wa |8 1849 N/A 5 15.98
YOGURT, RASPBERRY AND PEACH 48/40Z. LOWFAT YOGURT CASE 48/4 OZ. 5 1490 16.55 $ 1939 | § 12.95
0 TRANS FATS 500 Yo
UPSTATE FARMS BRAND ELAIT N/A 3 18.47
YOGURT, STRAW AND STRAW/BANANA YOPLAIT LOWFAT YOGURT CASE 48/4 OZ. § 1490 16.55 $ 1739 | 8 12.95
0 TRANS FATS 500
UPSTATE FARMS BRAND HOELAIT NIA $ 18.47
0 TRANS FAT $ 89.66( S 58.20 $ .67 | § 69.00
CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION
SAN SHREDED 4/5# CASE 4/5 LB, 20
DHERSE, PARMESANSHEY ; INFORMATION INFORMATION PROVIDED N/A s 67.80
1 TRANS FAT 3 4938 | § 37.40 8 5866 | § 42.00 Reserching exactly what kind
CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION of cheese they are bidding?
GHEESE, PIZZA'SHREDDED INFORMATION INFCRMATION PROVIDED [ ASE 45 LB. 2t Brand, ingrediants etc.
N/A 3 45.80
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BEAN, PINTO DRIED 50 LB. BAG 50 LB. 60[ 8 4380 § 25.61 (27.88
2675| § 27.28
12/31 OZ.. or 6/30 OZ. PACKAGES § 1990( 8§ 24.46 120.76
O TRANS FAT CASE 8/30
BEAN, REFRIED 6/30 OZ. CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION |gz. 300
INFORMATION PROVIDED N/A § 2445
WHOLE GRAIN CASE 6/20.8 $ 2994 $ 30,48 |28.94
0 TRANS FAT oz
CHILI MIX 6/20.8 CZ. 10298 CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION 80
INFORMATION PROVIDED N/A $ 30.15
CHIP, SALTED TORTILLA 2.0 OZ. BAGS SB 12 COMPLIANT CASE 1200] §  29.12] § 2247 [28.33
1201.5 OZ. N/A 3 21.28
GRAVY, TURKEY DRY 8/22 OZ. TRIO BRAND OR SIMILIAR CASEBHM13 20 5 44722| 8 28.30 |40.65
0z N/A $§ 33.07
IDAHOAN BRAND CASE 12/28 $  6127] 8 43.52
POTATO, INSTANT 12/26 OZ, BAGS 29700/00313 0Z. BAGS 150 41.03
O TRANS FAT N/A $ 53.59
BROWN RICE, 25 # PAR BOILED 32 10.19 [12.3
RICE, BROWN 25 LB. 0 TRANS FAT BAG25LR, e G N/A S 1165
TORTILLA, FLOUR 4.5 IN, 2412 CT. 28671 CASE 24/12 150] § 24.14 N/A 22 44
cT: N/A $ 2224
WHOLE GRAIN CASE 1810 $ 35.70] § 1631 |16.67
TORTILLA, WHEAT 10" 120 CT. 0 TRANS FATS LATAPATIA OR SIMILIAR [CT. 350
BRAND 15751 § 27.08
WHOLE GRAIN CASE 24/12 2 22
TORTILLA, WHEAT SMALL 6" 24/10 CT, bhphel o i a00f ¥ 182458 i 2295 o T
TOMATO PUREE IN 6 CASE 6/# 10 $ 23.18| % 15.11 |18.82
TOMATO PUREE 6/#10 BAGS POUCHES EQUIVALENT TO 6/#10 BAGS 200
CANS N/A $ 17.83
TACO SHELL LARGE 200 CT. MUST BE 1 GRAIN OR GREATER PER | CASE 200 3500 8§ 1672] § 1837 [15.22
SHELL. CT. N/A § 19.47
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BEAN, BLACK B#10 CASE 6410 500 § 2044 $ 17.09] WA |8 1751 2695 | 8 15.50
BEAN, GARBONZO 6/#10 PACKED IN WATER CASE 8410 150 hy 3067 8§ 19.29 N/A g 17.63 26.95 3 16.75
BEAN, GREEN 6/#10 Packed in water CASE BM10 60[ § 25.17]8% 1920 N/A | S 2052 Skos | B 20.00
BEAN, KIDNEY 6410 PACKED IN WATER CASE B4t10 2000 8 31988 2160 NA |$ 2294 26.05 | 8 21.50
CHICKEN STOCK 5 LB. TUB EACH5 LB. B0l §  61.61 N/A N/A $ 48.00 ) 78.80
CORN 8410 PACKED IN WATER CASE 6410 80 5§ 2781|8% 1862 N/A | § 2318 26.05 | 8 18.75
CRANBERRY SAUCE #10 CAN EACH 0 TRANS FAT CASE 6/#10 15| § 4352 $ 40.68| N/A |8 4261 N/A $ 46.72

GROWN AND PACKED IN U.S.A. $ 2879 % 18.52 N/A 3 21.02 3 18.63
FRUIT, APPLESAUGE 6/#10™ PACKED IN OWN JUICE OR WATER CASE 6/#10 100 N/A

0 TRANS FATS
FRUIT, APPLESAUCE CUPS 96/4.5 OZ. CASE 96/4.5 1000( § 17.06| $ 19.33 N/A g 1527 N/A $ 24.18

[e74

GROWN AND PACKED IN U.S.A $ 3982]% 29.35 N/A 3 34.18 b 31.79
FRUIT, MIXED 8/#10 PACKED IN OWN JUICE OR WATER CERBOHID 0 36.75

GROWN AND PACKED IN THE USA IN OWN S 4533 s 2710 ™A |$ 3384 S 31.29
FRUIT, PEACH SLICED 6#10 JUICE OR WATER CASE 6/#10 125 29.75

GROWN AND PACKED IN THE USA IN OWN S 4358]8S 26.48 N/A $ 3353 § 29.88
FRUIT, PEAR, SLICED 8410 JUICE OF WATER CASE 8/#10 125 29.75

GROWN AND PACKED IN U.5.A. $ 4407| % 25.58 N/A § 28.13 g 26.79
FRUIT, PINEAPPLE TIDBITS 6/#10 C?C_rléiD IN OWN JUICE OR CASE 8410 30 29.75

A

GRAVY, ROASTED TURKEY CANNED CASE 12/50 125| §  51.06| % 38.06 N/A $= 2133157 N/A b 37.99
12/50 OZ. Oz

OLIVES, BLACK SLICED § 3574|138 29.89 N/A 3 26.25 S 35.00
CLIVES, SLICED 6410 6/#10 CANS CASE B#10 30 46.00

0 TRANS FATS
PEPPER, JALEPENO 610 JALEPENOQ, SLICED 6410 CASE B/#10 125 §  44.00] $ 2075| 8 352708  21.05 5 $ 26.00

0 TRANS FATS 25.75
PEPPERS, CHIPOTLE ADOBEO 6410 PEPPERS, CHIPOTLE ADOBO 6/310 CANS CASE 6/#10 15 N/A N/A N/A |8 4491 NIA $ 57.19
PUMPKIN, CANNED 84410 CASE 8/#10 20 N/A $ 4075 % 4640 8%  31.89 NIA $ 42,08
SALSA, GREEN SALSA VERDE 6H10"* MILD FLAVOR CASE 6/#10 80 N/A 3 4315 NA [§ 2773 WiA § 42.66
SALSA, RED 6#10™ MILD FLAVOR CASE 8/#10 100 N/A S 24,57 N/A $  41.79 36.75 S 34.79
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EF. &
BEEF PATTY. RAW 41 LB, Rl NORHLERS CASE101B, s S 24l 2880 NA | S 5486 | WA | F 2680
BLUEBERRIES, FROZEN 3018, FROZEN 20 LB. OR 30 LB. CASE CASE20LB. 50| § 44,69 $ 26| % s150| 8 3036 N/A 4 35.92
BREAD, BUN HAMBURGER S5.CT. WHOLE SRAN USREKERVERANZ BRANDND: | sasg mect, 2o ¥ 1374 g 1672| NA | 1839 |5 1999 [ 5 1881 |site o site delivery
BREAL DINHERROEL 1820T, oy w e Anie 2302 WA |5 27858 3as|s 3206
WHOLE GRAIN BAKERCRAFT BRAND NO SPECIAL g 3 27.4 - " .
HREAD, HOAGIE ROLL 72CT. Pty casET2CT. sof FFEL| T ] |8 2s00| s 2240 |8 2040 |siteroshe delivery
BREAD, HOT DOG BUN 98 CT ™™ US BAKERY/FRANZ CASESECT. 300( § 21.30 % " o L
e W SLEHERIN H 1788 NA | S 183483 1974 [§ 1937 |site o site delivery]
BROCCOLI [QF 20 LB. |QF 20-30 LB. FROZEN CASE 65 L8, 000§ 1763 [ ¢ 1318| NA |8 1896 WA § 1426
CARROTS. CONZ0LE, IQF 2030 LB. CASE CASE 20 1B, 1000 § 1645 ¢ 47| N | § 1647 NiA § 1187
CARROTS, |OF DICED 20 LSS, CASE 20 W F 1173
L8s, dE 1134 NA& | § 1471 NA | § 1278
CHICKEN, WHOLE MUSCLE CHICKEN NUGGET WHOLE MUSCLE CHICKEN NUGGET FETE ] .
WHOLE GRAIN BREADING .09 No 5
CN LABEL PROVIDEC oRE m WholeMue | A |eMEdIsH WA |8 4868
CHICKEN, WHOLE MUSCLE CKICKEN TENDER WHOLE MUSCLE CHICKEN TENDER S 107.40 N ’
\WHOLE GRAIN BREADING CN LABEL PROVIDED | SASE 0 99.39.50 N/A |iS; 19835 WA |$ 9950
WHOLE MUSCLE BREADED CHICKEN PATTY 3-4 $ 11599 17.80 N
OUNCE. /50 Nat
CHIGKEN, WHOLEMUSOLE PATTY WHOLE GRAIN BREADING CN LABEL PROVIDED EAsk 20 Whole Muscle Nix §; 788 NiA $ 5640
DTRANS FAT CASE 724 $ 30.00
CORN DOG, CHICKEN 72 CT. CN LABEL PREFERRED OR NUTRITION oz 80D $ 2475 NA | % 2806 | NA S 2747
INFORMATION PROVIDED
RN, I £ CASE 20 50|
CORN. 1QF 20 LBS ey 8 18 g 1302| N |§ 92| A |5 27
CRANBERRIES 1GF 20 LBS. CASE 2018 s 4138 ¢ 1971 § 2052| 8 1542 NA |5 3941
WH 0 500
FRENCH TOAST STICKS 1212 LB. BAGS WHGLE R CAgETH § 3840 ¢ 535| wa |'S 35| wa | §  3se0 Brisid
GEE JUICEE, N T. OZEN JUICE BARS NO ADDED SUGAR CASE 100( § 2
ICEE JUICEE, FROZEN 100 C FROZ s § 2127 ¢ 1959 NA | § 2147 N/A NIA
LE £ 2 CA: 2000 =
JUIGE, APPLE 4 OZ,, FROZEN 70 CT, QLSE T4 $ 834 § 792 WA $ 7.58 NIA NIA
JUICE, ORANGE 4 GZ., FROZEN, 7D CT. CASE 70/4 1800| § 12.07 <
bt s 1oo| Na o |8 1067 | N Nia
NCODLES, TERIYAK), FROZEN 4/5 LB. YAKISOBA NCODLES |YAKISOBA BRAND TERIYAKI ] 22.29 3 .
\WHOLE GRAIN 4/ 5 LB. BAGS CASE 750 s 2289 NA | S 2018 NiA $ 2264
SEAS, FROZEN 20 LB, CASE2018. W 51965 ¢ 1905 NA | $ 2047 NiA s 1399
PPERONI, 5 CASE 30
PEFPERONDIREDIRARS o § 4002 g 3003 N NIA NA s 3923
2/125 LB, BAGS PER CASE S 95.84
PEPPERCNI, SLICED 2112.5 LB. ™ G TRANS FAT CASE 2518, s 69.15 [NEN § 5869 WA § 8737
PORK BASED PEPPERON|
z 0 SE 615 3 N
POTATO, TATER TOTS 6/5 LB. O TRANS FATS E; E:AGS 1000| § 23.63 § 1788 N/A s 21s9|$ 21208 1852
SEASCNED POTATO WEDGES GASE 65
POTATO, WEDGE SAVORY 6/5 L8, Tehal ] ooo| ¥ 2800y 1676) NA | § 2228| WA |$S 2000
SALAMI, 82 LB, BAGS™™ SLICED SALAMI CASE Bi2 LE. A5 2080 ¢ 1028| NA |5 7867 ik s 13
BIG SPOON BRAND 36/83 CASE 36/83 g 1718
SORBET, 36/83 GRAM G GRAM 800 NiA NiA NA NiA $ 1440
GLUTEN FREE ALL FLAVORS
TAQUITOS, CHICKEN 140 CT. WHOLE GRAIN CASE 200| § 52 -
DTRANS FAT ¥ 27 3952 NA | § 4133 A |8 a7
TURKEY, FRANK B/1 LE. 20088, CN LASEL PROVIDED CASEZ20LB. 150 5 "
10 OR 20 LB, CASE $ 16330 21.00| NA | § 1261 NA | § 1267 Pack Size
WAFFLE, ROUND 144 CT. CASE 144 CT 250 N/A § 19.27 A 5 1462 NIA s 19.40
BEEF, BONELESS CHUCK ROAST CN LABEL PROVIDED NIA G i 1B e ik S5
/ | g 2,
BEEF. 80TTOM ROUND CN LABEL PRCVIDED NIA A NIA P 253 NA 24516
PORK SONELESS BUTT CN LABEL PROVIDED NA 180% N[5 14 NIA 1,751
PORK BONELESS SHOULDER CN LABEL PROVIDED NiA ki sk | 4 T {45
BIG SPOCN BRAND 24123 CASE 24123 S 2207
YOGURT, FROZEN 24/133 GRAM GRAM GRAM 800 NIA NIA NiA NiA $ 2280 site lo site delivery|
ALL FLAVORS
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BAKING POWDER 50 L8 501B. BAG CASE 50 LE. % s 32418 6362 § gooo| $ 5218 NIA $ 42.16
BAKING SODA 24/1 L8, BOXES 24/1 LB. BOXES éﬁ:iié’; 20 s 1688 S 1574] § 2340 % 1522 NIA £ 14.95

4000 CT, REAL CHOCOLATE CHIPS 50.83. NIA $ 51,50
CHOGGLATE CHIPS 4000 €T. 0 TRANS FAT NUTRITICN LABEL PRCVIDED Case 4000ct 150 $ 6957 % 51.52| $ 79.80
CHOCOLATE CHIPS, M & M MINI'S 2518, CASE CASE 25LB. i NiA s s7.06] s1it00] § 8600 N/A $ 86.13
COGOA, BAKING 25# 35 LB, CASE CASE 251 0 $25.96/51b NA g107.75| S13/51 N/A 3 81.65
CONFETTI S # g:u;I:XTUPPIng 20%5L8. 20 NIA NA $ 1935 § 5515 N/A $ 66.47
CRANBERRIES, DRIED 25 LB. CASLEE!? P § s604| % s637| & cogo| § 5214 N/A s 56.60
DOLGH CONDITIONER, 850050 LB, BAGSG LB B § 17997 N/A §149.10 N/A MA $ 59.35
£GG, DRIED 50 LB. WHOLE EGG, DRIED 50 # OR 6/2 # BAGS CASES0LE, i@ s 17776 WA $129.15 N/A N/A $ 10950
FLOUR, ALL PURPOSE ENRICHED 50 LB, UNBLEAGHED FLOUR BAG SOLB. 800 s 1725 s 10.99] $ 1064 $ 119 NIA 3 12.00 |brand and pack size
;(ﬁ;& GIUSTOS BRAND WHOLE WHEAT Egg‘[gaﬂgﬁnﬁfﬁkpnmsm FINE BAGS0LE, 750 s 1884 NIA § 25.00 s 1260 NiA s 23.00 |brand and pack size
FLOUR, WHITE WHOLE WHEAT 50 LB, BAG S0 LB. - s 1764 8 15| 5 1ese| § 1181 NIA s 1217
GARLIC,CHOPPED INWATER GARLIC, CHOPPED IN WATER @ 25 NFA N/A NiA § 2043 NiA § 40.70
HONEY 30LB. 5B, OR LARGER SIZE EACH 30 LB. 2 s 99508 $157] ¢ o200 $ 817 N/A 3 58.20
ICING FRUIT LEMON 10 LB. EACH10LB, 50 § 13333 N/A § 2235 N/A N/A N/A
[CING FRUIT GRANGE 10 LB, CASE10LB, 0 § 10056 N/A s 19.90 N/A N/A NIA
ICING, BANANA 10 LB. EACH 20 $ 27.00 NIA s 23.05 N/A N/A NIA
ICING, RASPBERRY 10 LB, EACH 1DLB, i@ s 13879 /A NIA N/A NfA N/A
OIL, OLIVE 6/1 GAL. OLIVE OIL, 6/1 GALLON CASEGE‘::L = s 16000] 5 o876 | § soos| B 4644 NfA $ 72.09
OIL, VEG 35 LB, VEGETABLE/SOYBEAN CIL CASE 3518, - s 4538 1772] § 1os0| S 18658 2075 | § 18,82
OIL, VEGETABLE 61 GAL™™ casg::l s 6573 NA wa | § 3524 N/A $ 40.55
RAISINS 3018, BULK CASE20LE. s s621|s 52.07| § 3900| § 3805 N/A 5 34.80
SPICE, CINNAMON 25 LB, CASE 2518, 5 § 1887] % 7565 § T242| S 340 N/A $ 156,00
SPICE, GARLIC POWDER 6 LB. BTL.6LB. 1 § w6l 60| wa | S 3967 N/A $ 39.63
SPICE. ITALIAN SEASONING 3.25 LB, BTL2250B. - s 4997 s 15| wa | § 2248 NIA 5 12.06
SPICE, SALT 505, BAGS0 LS. 75 s 684| 8 505| § 995 $ 789 N/A s 16,74 |Pack Size
SPICE, SUGAR S0LB. BAG 50 LB. Frr s 3569 % 2079| § 1995 § 2497 NIA s 21.95
SPICE, SUGAR POWDERED 50 L8, BAG 50 LE. e s 2190 § 2833| § 24909 § 28353 N/A 5 25.00
SPICE. SUGAR, BROWN 50 LB, BAGSOLE. 100 s 2190 s 1505] § 2450 ¥ 2953 NIA - 25.22 |Pack Size
SPICE, TAJIN CLASICO 121141 0Z.~* 1321551 i a0 s 4480 % 43.69 N/A N/A 23.75 12/50z | 8 47.53
SPRINKLES, CARTON 6 LB. COOKIE TOPPING 6 LB, CARTON camor:; 0 § 4964 NIA $ 12.50 * 2o L # e
SUGAR CRYSTALS, WHITE 25 LB. BAG25LE. 2 § 1972 NIA § 3100 NAA N/A $ 7416
SUGAR, CRYSTALS 8 LB, GAHTOI:; 15 s 2582 NIA § 22.05 N/A N/A § 74.16
VANILLA 4/t GAL, gz%m;g\r#vmn.m giiEm 15 s 28370 % 2823| § 1420 § 3366 NIA s 2785
VITAL WHEAT GLUTEN 50 LB, BAG S0 LB. 10 NA NIA $ 67.00 N/A NiA 5 53.24
YEAST, SAF 20/t LB, LESAFRE LESAFRE BRAND 201 LB, CASE 25:;. 156 § 53.29 NA s ds00| § 958 NIA $ 49.85
BANANAS, FROZEN IQF 20 LBS, IQF BANANA CHIPS E;.:T.E E3) 06 NIA 3 | A | FO1955 N/A $ 3422
LEMON FLAVECO 5 LB. VITA PAK BRAND JAR5LE. o NIA N/A $ 22.99 NIA N/A s 118.19




Chico Unified School District

Nutritional Services

Price Quote for Delivery to Warehouse
July 1, 2017 through June 31, 2018

Est. Bro
Annual | GOLD ROB 5. ":"
ltem Description Product Specification | Pack Size | Usage | STAR | Danielson | ROSS | SYSCO| S&L =
BOX, 17X 17X 12 CARDBOARD EACH
3000 N/A N/A NfA NIA N/A N/A
BOX, 17 x 17 x 68 CARDBOARD EACH
500 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
BOX, PIZZA 16" S0 CT. 16 IN. PIZZA BOX CASE 50 CT.
30 N/A 19.47 N/A $ 16.36 18.34 N/A
CARDBOARD INSERT 16 X 18 EACH
1500 N/A NIA NA N/A 37.48 NFA
CHINESE FOOD PAIL 450 CT. SIZE 26, 9 X 50 NO HANDLE CASE 450
CT. 30 N/A 30.54 NfA N/A 50.41 N/A
FOOD BOAT 1 #1000 CT. 1 LB. COATED FOOD TRAY CASE 4/250
CT. 300 NFA $ 17.73 N/A $ 14.39 15.80( & 14.99
FOOD BOAT, 4 OZ. 1000 CT. 0560 4 OZ, LINED FOOD BOAT CASE 4/500
CT. 50 N/A 11.88 N/A 5 12.35 12211 & 10.76
FOOD BOAT, 6 OZ. 1000 CT. 0561 6 OZ. COATED/ LINED FOOD BOAT CASE 4/250
CT. 150 N/A 13.03 N/A N/A 1354 | & 12.87
NAPKIN, DISPENSER 7 X 13 CASE 20/500
BT 30 N/A 20.39 N/A NFA 2454 | % 20.80
NAPKIN, SCOTT CARTRIDGE SCOTT 98908 SCOTT 98908 CASE 6/875
6 X875 CT. 80 N/A NIA N/A $ 48,88 46.56 N/A
PAPER, CHECKERED 12 X 12 CASE 5/1000
CT. 20 N/A 70.68 N/A $ 61.56 70.48| $ 57.65
PAPER, WHITE DRY WAX 16X16 3/1000 16 X 16 WHITE DRY WAX PAPER CASE 3/1000
e, CT. 10 N/A 60.11 NIA N/A 60.06 | $ 50.00
PIZZA BAKING TRAYS 15" PACTIV BRAND 15" WHITE PCS 01505 |CASE 250
BLACK PEP 01505 CT. 50 NFA NIA N/A N/A G6.89 N/A
PIZZA BAKING TRAYS 16.5" PACTIV BRAND WHITE PCS 01705 CASE 150
BLACK PEP 01705 CT. 50 N/A NFA N/A s 101.45 68.98 N/A
TISSUE, PICK- UP 10 X 10 ™* CASE 12/500
BT 20 N/A $ 28.39 N/A $ 39.35 6197 % 45.24
TISSUE, PICK-UP 8 X 6 ™ CASE
20/1000 CT. 10 N/A NA 51 $ 51.01 5429 % 36.56
TRAY, 8 X 8 CLEAR HINDGED 250CT. CASE 200
CT. 75 N/A $ 42.49 N/A $ 42.34 36.15| % 43.92
TRAY, 5 X 5 CLEAR HINDGED CASE 500
ET. 40 N/A 37.40 N/A ] 24.70 2458 | $ 38.67
TRAY, NUTRITICON 500 CT. RECYCLED FOOD TRAY CASE 500
ET. 1800 N/A 16.67 N/A $ 17.31 18.06 | $ 16.29




Chico Unified School District

Nutritional Services

Price Quote for Delivery to Warehouse
July 1, 2017 through June 31, 2018

Est.
Annual United Crown
Item Description Product Specification Pack Size | Usage | GOLD STAR| Danielson | SYSCO PPF Textile S&L Dist Comments
ALCOHOL WIPES 100 CT, BOX 100 CT. 50/ NiA N/A S 7.95 N/A N/A £ 4684 N/A
APRON, DISPOSABLE 50 CT. BOX 100 CT. 50 N/A 3 26441 % 7123 N/A N/A $ 5623 N/A
BAG, BROWN PAPER #5 /500 CT. 500 CT. PAPER CASE 500 80 N/A 3 940| 8 7.47 N/A N/A 4 9.64 N/A
CT.
BAG, BUN PAN 21 X8 X 35 CASE 200 50 N/A S 1799 $ 17.13 N/A N/, SR1657 N/A
CT.
BLEACH, CHLORINE GAL.*™** CASE 611 10 N/A $ 9.07( S 10.03 N/A N/A 3 9.45 N/A
GAL.
BOWL, BLACK PLASTIC 12 OZ. 500 CT. CASE 500 N/A 5 72611 8 2669 N/A N/A 5 5647 N/A
4605817 ANCHOR 4605817 CT. 450
ANCHOR PACKAGING
BOWL, BLACK PLASTIC 16 OZ. 500 CT. ANCHOR BRAND 4605820 CASE 500 200 N/A $ 72611 8§  29.08 N/A N/A $  63.25 N/A
46085820 CT.
CHOP STICKS 1000 CT. CASE 1000 50 N/A 3 1871|§ 13.14 N/A N/A § 2208(3F 2650
&L
@ MSDS REG. CASE 12/32 N/A $ 33.70( % 3521 N/A N/A § 3749 N/A
CLEANER, 409 32 OZ. 1 GALLON CONCENTRATE ALSO oz. A0
CLEANER, OVEN 24 OZ. CAN™ 6/CAN CASE MSDS CASE 6/20 20 N/A N/A S 2808 N/A N/A $ 27.92 N/A
0OZ.
CLEANER, STAINLESS STEEL 17 OZ. *** MSDS CASE 6117 20 N/A N/A § 2740 N/A N/A S 4726 N/A
0z
CLEANSER 21 OZ. CAN ** COMET OR SIMILAR BRAND MSDS CASE 24/21 5 N/A $ 2152 8 3236 N/A N/A S 2299 N/A
ozZ.
CONTAINER, HOAGIE CHC843 250 CT. CASE 250 150 N/A 4 61391 § 29.48 N/A N/A $ 2744| 8 3494
CT.
CUP, 2 0Z. CLEAR PORTION 2500 CT. PAPER PORTICN CUPS CASE 2500 60 N/A 3 24658 2082 N/A N/A S 2158| % 23.09
CT.
CUP, 4 OZ CLEAR PORTION CASE 2500 60 N/A 3 45.67( % 3719 N/A N/A $ 3807 S 3798
cT.
CUP, HEARTY SOUP 12 OZ. W/ LID 12 OZ. SOUP CUPS, WITH LIDS CASE 250 50 /A $ 66.96] §  57.06 N/A N/A S 5139 N/A
CT.
FOIL 12" 1000 FT. EACH 1000 20 N/A b 16.18| 3 1436 N/A N/A $ 17765 17.88
FT.
FOIL 18" 100C FT. EACH 1000 25 N/A 23.90 Standard | §  32.77 N/A N/A S 2595 % 26.68
FT. 34.52 Heavy HEAVY
FOIL WRAP, CHEESEBURGER 4/500 CT. LINED FOIL SHEETS 10 X 14 CASE 4/500 60 N/A 77.30 SO N/A N/A N/A $ 8087] 8 6333
CT.
FOIL WRAP, RED CHECKERED 4/500 CT, LINED FOIL SHEETS 10 X 14 CASE 4/500 20 N/A 77.30 SO N/A N/A N/A $ 8087|% 4976
CT.
FOIL, SHEETS 12 X 10.75 500 CT. =™ CASE 6/500 15 N/A 3 43328 6556 N/A N/A $ 44218 4414
CT.
FOIL, SHEETS 9 X 10.75 500 CT, *** CASE 6/500 15 N/A b 347718 3321 N/A N/A § 3486( 3% 33.86
CT.
FOIL, WRAP UNPRINTED 4/500 *** FOIL LINED SHEETS 10 X14 CASE 4/500 30 N/A 7730 SO N/A N/A N/A S  7326| & 5994
CT.
FOIL, WRAP, HAMBURGER 4/500 CT. LINED FOIL SHEETS 10 X 14 CASE 4/250 40 N/A 77.30 SO N/A N/A N/A $ 8087 % 6333
CT.
FORK, BLACK PLASTIC 1000 CT. CASE 1000 30 N/A 11.08 80 § 2214 N/A N/A S 1621 % 6.96

CT.




FORK, PLASTIC 1000 CT. g?SE 1000 50 N/A $ 323 % 8.60 N/A N/A $ 6.21 6.96
FORK, PLASTIC WRAPPED 1000 CT. géSE 1000 500 N/A $ 10.16] § 1251 N/A N/A $ 1113 10.93
GLOVES, ORANGE DISH LARGE PR, FA;R g0 18(12et) N/A § 27.04 N/A $ 1800| 8% 19.08 N/A
GLOVES, ORANGE DISH MED FR. PAIR 40 18(12ct) N/A §  27.04 N/A $ 1800|§ 19.08 N/A
GLOVES, POLY STUDENT 10/100 CT, =~ 10/100 CT. MEDIUM AND LARGE g¢5E 10/100 10 2670 § 3745] § 5.67 N/A $ 2670]$ 5485 N/A
GLOVES, VINYL DISP LARGE 100 CT. BO‘X 100CT. 800 2.03(3.5ml) $ 20718 2521 237518 2030 % 2449 2.00
powder free
GLOVES, VINYL DISP MED 100 CT. BOX 100 CT. 500 2.03(3.5ml) S 207118 2521 23751 8 20308 2449 2.00
powder free
GLOVES, VINYL EXTRA LARGE 100 CT. BCX 100 2.03(3.5ml) s 20711 $ 2521 237518 2030 § 2449 2.00
powder free
HAIRNET, LARGE 100 CT. (E:?CH 100 80 69.00| § 83541 8§ 10131 N/A $ 69.00] § 13926 9.31
HAT, BOUFFANT, WHITE " 107100 CT. PER CASE g-.?SE 10/100 10 19.50 | § 1500 § 1455 N/A $ 19508 2132 N/A
HAT, OVERSEAS 100 CT, - 5/100 CT. PER CASE aolx 100 CT. 10, N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A $ 6876 N/A
KNIVES, PLASTIC 1000 CT. gﬁSE 1000 80 N/A $ 523] 8 8.81 N/A N/A $ 6.21 5.83
LID, FOR 12 & 16 OZ. BLACK EOWL 500 ANCHOR BRAND LH 5800 D 2585 500 600 N/A 3 49518 2116 N/A N/A $ 4090 N/A
S;S. 4 OZ. 2500 CT. g?ISE 2500 30 N/A 3 2820 5 2845 N/A N/A § 3034 28,98
MUFFIN LINER, EACH 500 CT.~ 6X 2.5 In. 10000 CT. OR SIMILAR g?suz 20/600 0 N/A N/A $ 2595 N/A N/A $ 12147 N/A
GVENWITS PR, PAR 5 A N/A $ 1179 WA NA |$  633]| WA
PAN LINER 1000 CT. CASE 1000 200 N/A S 26428 2657 N/A N/A § 2390 28.00
PAN SAVER 12 X 34, 100 €T, EE,’:;;VEESFLSETQNDOVEN PAN LINERS 1 oox 10067, 200 NiA NiA § 28| WA WA 18 54341 NA
PLASTIC WRAP 18" EACH 60 N/A $ 12121 8§ 12.07 N/A N/A $ 1332 12.22
PLASTIC WRAP, 12" EACH 30 N/A $ 880] 8 8.84 N/A N/A $ 9.88 10.31
PLATE, BLACK 10 "3 COMPARTMENT CASE 500 50 N/A 3 74471 8 7142 N/A N/A § 7am 36.42
POTHOLDER EACH = €"x 8" Size, 6 ct. pka, PKG.6CT. 150 N/A N/A 5 9.45 N/A N/A $ 17.02 N/A
SCRUBBER, GREEN PAD, EACH EACH 100 N/A $ 4.68] 8 8.58 N/A N/A $ 1057 544
SCRUBBER, STAINLESS STEEL 12CT. ™ |STAINLESS STEEL SCRUBBER 1207 |CASE T2 CT. 12 N/A 3 1883 8 1675 N/A N/A $ 3085 3.78
SPONGE, GREEN/YELLOW 5 CT, = CASE 8/5 CT. 15 N/A 3 26.64]$ 3374 N/A N/A 3 1144 N/A
SPOON, PLASTIC 1000 CT g#SE 1000 350 N/A $ 523 % 5.73 N/A N/A $ 6.21 5.83
SPORK g?‘SE 1000 750 N/A $ 523| § 5073 N/A N/A 5 6.21 10.99
THERMOMETER, DIGITAL DIGITAL FOOD THERMOMETER EACH 60 N/A N/A $ 950 N/A N/A 3 975 N/A
THERMOMETER, FRIDGE/FREEZER 1 OR 2 PER BOX EACH 20 N/A N/A $ 685 N/A N/A $ 3.50 2.21
THERMOMETER, OVEN EACH 30 N/A N/A S 5.43 N/A N/A 5 3.90 221
TOWEL, DISPOSABLE 2 PACK Variety gigﬁ 2 250 68.4(80ct) N/A $ 3330 N/A N/A $  67.79 N/A




Chico Unified School District

Nutrition Services

2455 Carmichael Dr.

Company:

Signature:

Chico, CA 95928 =z
= Printed Name:
Vince Enserro: Director of Nutrition ‘9/)}
Crystal O'Rear: Nutrition Specialist /V\SE {/ICE.‘.') Date:
Shawn Lavin: Warehouse Manager cHico usp
Item Description Pack Size Months Es;g::?ﬂ Danco PPF S&L
Used Case Usage
Apple, Size 138ct, Fuji Fancy 40 Ib. year round 500 NO BID $ 22751 9% 2525
Apple, Size 138ct, Gala Fancy 40 Ib. year round 500 NO BID 3 22751 % 25.25
Apple, Size 138ct, Green Fancy 40 Ib. year round 200 NO BID $ 2275 | % 25.25
Apple, Size 198ct, Fuji Fancy 40 Ib. year round 300 NO BID $ 22.75 | % 25.00
Apple, Size 198ct, Gala Fancy 40 Ib. year round 300 NO BID $ 2275 | % 25.00
Apple, Sliced, bulk 20/2 Ib. year round 500 NO BID $54.75 (1.371b) | $22.75 (1.891b)
Apple, Sliced, |.W. 200/20z | year round 400 NO BID $26.75 100/20z | $51.66 200/20z
Banana, Petite 150 count | year round 1300 |NO BID $ 19.75 | $ 19.45
Broccoli Florets, precut 4/3 Ib. cs | year round 750 NO BID $ 1975 | $ 20.45
Brocceoli Florets, precut 3 Ib. pack |year round 50 NO BID $ 525 % 5.50
Cantaloupe, whole case seasonal 40 NO BID $ 14751 % 15.90
Carrots, Diced 3/8 IN 51b. bag |yearround 40 NO BID $ 7.00(9% 9.40
Carrots, Stick Brick Pack 1/5 Ib. bag | year round 50 NO BID 3 7.00 | $ 9.40
Carrots, shredded 51Ib. bag |yearround 40 NO BID $ 6.50 | $ 3.85
Carrots, mini, snack pak 100/20z | year round 3000 |NO BID 3 2150 | $ 20.45
Cauliflower, florette 31b. bag |yearround 50 NO BID $ 850 | % 8.40
Celery Sticks, precut 4" 51b. bag |yearround 1100 |NO BID $ 8.50 | 9% 7.95
Basil 1lb year round 300 NO BID 3 10.75 | % 7.95
Cilantro 1lb year round 250 NO BID $2.25 3ct 3 4.55
Coleslaw 51b. bag |yearround 10 NO BID $ 3751 % 3.95
Cucumbers, whole 3ct year round 500 NO BID $ 2.25 | $3.95 5#
Cucumbers, whole 36ct/25 Ib. | year round 500 NO BID 3 1275 % 15.95

Page 1 of 3




Cucumbers, sliced 1/4" 51b year round 700 NO BID $ 10.75 | % 9.65
Grapes Lunch Bunch case seasonal 650 NO BID $ 2475 | $ 28.40
Honeydew, whole case seasonal 40 NO BID $ 10.75 | $ 14.75
Jicama, pre-cut sticks 51b bag |[yearround 1600 |NO BID $ 11.95| % 11.40
Kiwifruit 110ct V.F. Bulk seasonal 500 NO BID $ 2175 % 20.45
Lemon 7 ct year round 20 NO BID $ 2.40 | MARKET
Lettuce, Romaine chopped 6/21Ibcs |yearround 1300 |NOBID $ 16.00 | $ 17.00
Lettuce, lcebureg, shredded 4/5 |b. bag | year round 500 NO BID $ 13.50 | $ 14.80
Limes 21b year round 25 NO BID $ 2.50 | $5.70 5#

Limes Tct year round 125 NO BID 3 1.75 | $5.70 5#
Mushroom, Medium pound year round 25 NQO BID 3 300|% 1.45
Nectarine, size 64-72 251b seasonal 160 NO BID $ 23.75 | & 21.00
Onicns, yellow 6ct year round 30 NO BID $ 250 % 2.30
Onions, Red Bet year round 10 NC BID $ 250 % 4.00
Onions, red sliced 1/4" 51b bag |year round 30 NO BID $ 1275 | $ 8.55
Onions, red sliced 1/8" 5lb bag |yearround 30 NO BID $ 1275 | $ 8.55
Onions, green bunch year round 30 NO BID $1.255.50z 3 1.15
Oranges, size 138, Choice 40 Ib. case |year round 1500 |NO BID 3 1750 | $ 17.25
Peach, size 64-72 case seasonal 160 NO BID $ 23751 % 22.75
Peas, Sugar Snap Bag 21b year round 150 NO BID 3 500|9% 6.25
Peas, Sugar Snap 10 1b year round 100 NO BID 3 2175 | $ 26.15
Pears, Red, 120-135ct 40 Ib. case | seasonal 200 NO BID 3 24751 % 27.30
Pears, Bartlett, 120-135 ct 40 Ib. case | seasonal 200 NO BID 3 2475 | % 29.55
Pepper, Green Bell 6 ct year round 30 NO BID 7.50 5# $ 9.95
Pepper, Green Diced 1/2" 51b year round 10 NO BID 3 12.75 | % 14.80
Pepper, Red Bell 6 ct year round 115 NO BID $7.50 5# $ 13.05
Pepper, Yellow Bell B ct year round 15 NO BID $11.50 5# 3 4.55
Pineapple, fresh, 7 count single layer | seasonal 75 NO BID 3 1450 | $ 16.20
Plums, Red/Black size 40-45 case seasonal 125 NO BID $ 23759 34.00
Potato, Russet 100ct Ib year round 5 NO BID $ 3.60 | $14.8 100ct
Spinach, cleaned, cello pack 4/2.5 [b. bag | year round 1000 |NO BID $ 15.00 | $ 17.05
Spinach, cleaned, cello pack 2.5 |b. bag |year round 500 NO BID 3 400 1|9 4.55
Squash, zucchini (b year round 25 NO BID $6.75 5# $12.5 20#
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Strawberries, flat 8/1# seasonal 150 NO BID $ 11.75 | 3% 18.20
Tangerines, Minneola case seasonal 25 NO BID 3 1950 | $ 38.65
Tangerine, Murcott case seasonal 25 NO BID $ 24751 % 38.65
Tangerine, Satsuma Mandarin case seasonal 200 NO BID 3 2150 | $ 38.65
Tomatoes, 5X6 22Ib year round 165 NO BID $ 19.50 | $ 18.20
Tomatoes, Large Loose 22b seasonal 100 NO BID $ 2150 | $ 2275
Tomatoes, Grape 10lb year round 110 NO BID $ 1875 | $ 15.90
Watermelon, whole medium 3-4ct 351b seasonal 50 NO BID $ 1975 | § 22.75
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2017-18 produce bid award summary
6.12.2017

Concerning the 2017-18 school year produce bid award | recommend the following awards for produce.
Based on criteria set forth in the bid packet | have determined that the bid be awarded as follows.

Pro-Pacific Fresh supply produce as set forth in the 2017-18 bid packet, Pro-Pacific Fresh be awarded
produce to CUSD Elementary school sites starting on July 1, 2017 and conclude June 30, 2018.

S&L Food Sales supply produce as set forth in the 2017-18 bid packet, S&L Food Sales be awarded
produce to CUSD secondary school sites starting July 1, 2017 and conclude June 30, 2018.

**% This bid award is the same award as the 2016-17 school year.

Vince Enserro



